AGENDA
Wayne County Commissioners’ Regular Session of April 18, 2018

* Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag

*» Call to Order & Roll Call of Commissioners Present

* Approval of Agenda

* Approval of minutes from Regular Session held April 11, 2018 and public meetings and/or
hearings held April 11, 2018 — April 17, 2018

Date Res.# Resolution Title

4/18 | 2018-175 | Approval of County Bills

4/18 | 2018-176 | Approval of County Home Bills

4/18 | 2018-177 | Appropriation Transfer Approval

4/18 | 2018-178 | Fund Transfer Approval

418 | 2018-179 | Personnel Change Approval

4/18 | 2018-180 | Travel Expense Approval

4/18 | 2018-181 | Special Event Approval

4/18 | 2018-182 | Approval of Plat for Bryor Ridge Subdivision

4/18 | 2018-183 | Authorization to Accept Unit Prices for Equipment and Labor Rates




Resolution No. 2018-175

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Subject:  Approval of County Bills

It was moved by Mr. Amstutz and seconded by Mrs. Obrecht that the following resolution be
adopted:

Computer run dated April 17, 2018 for County Bills in the amount of $270,610.33, Interagency
Transaction/Payment batch #5486 & 5485 in the amount of $19,640.40, and any Then & Now
Certificates are hereby approved for payment.

As taxing authority, the Then & Now Certificates submitted as of this date for the Board of
Elections, Children Services, Department of Developmental Disabilities, Soil and Water and
Veterans Services are approved for processing by the Auditor.

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smail yea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted and{jolrnatized by said Board on _said date.




Resolution No. 2018-176

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Subject:  Approval of County Home Bills

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

Computer run dated April 17, 2018 for County Home Bills in the amount of $51,942.44,
Interagency Transaction/Payment batch #5483 in the amount of $161,959.52, and any Then &
Now Certificates are hereby approved for payment.

The vote is as follows: Ann M, Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that

the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted and/jgumalig\ed by said Bogrd oprsaid date.
? LT P
(L Lane Z/Q\-

" Diane-t. AusenClerk \




Resolution No. 2018-177

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18, 2018
Subject:  Appropriation Transfer Approval

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following appropriation
amounts be transferred by the Wayne County Auditor.

Job & Family To cover vehicle maintenance cost

$5,000.00 From Other Exp. 8§ HOOOH34 | 026.0172.06.5900.000.000

To Vehicle Maint. HOO0OH16 | 026.0171.06.5170.000.000

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smail yea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted ayjoumaliged by said A said date.
!




Resolution No. 2018-178

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Subject:  Fund Transfer Approval

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

Department Amount From From To To
(Fund) Approp Acct {Fund) Receipt Acct
Municipal Court | $84,193.27 Municipal Court Fund 020 (B20) Court System Fund 023(B50}
Computerization Bo20B02 Computerization RBO50B09
Transfers 020.3405.02.6150. | Transfers in Muni Ct 023.3400.00.4904.
000.000 000.000
Court ordered transfer of computerization funds

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted anqjgmnalizqq by said Board on,Said date.




Resolution No. 2018-179

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18, 2018
Subject:  Personnel Change Approval

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

Department Name Title Eftective Date Status Change
Job & Family | Dawn Streit Investigator 2 4/23-25/2018 suspension

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted anypurﬁaiizeg by said y‘ .




Resolution

Board of Wayne County Conmumissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

No.2018-180

Adopted: April 18,2018
Subject:  Travel Expense Approval

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

Dept./Person Where Date Travel Travel Seminar, Conf., Mtg., etc.
{taxable)
Auditor
Jarra Underwood Medina 4/20/18 40.40 NE Dist. Mtg.
Common Pleas /
Adult Probation
Cheryl Gerwig, Cindy Wooster 4112, 5/24, 987.50 Policy & Procedure Trng.
Kuhl, Matt Zaleski, 6/28. 8/23/18
Dominic Palmucci, Brandi ’
Couch, Courtney Curtis,
Trina Wudarzewski
Commissioners
Patrick Herron, Misty Cleveland | 5/9/18 (in -0- Delta Dental Consumer Advisory
White, Barb Chapin place of 4/27) Commitiee Meetings
Cms / Info. Serv.
{Microfilm)
Dave Hodgson Wooster 7/318 195.00 Excel Basics
Cindy Shull Wooster 6118 195.00 Excel Basics
Engineer
Mark Spademan, Eric Liew | Sandusky [ 4/25/18 50.00 Geotechnical Materials
Job & Family
Aaron Vizzo Columbus | 5/1/18 120.00 12.00 | Northwoods Super User Trng.
Sherry Vitallo Carrollton 5/4,5/11,5/30, 350.00 72.00 | OHSTS Launching Leadership
6/4, 612,
6/25/18
Juv./Probate Court
Judge Wiles Ashtabula Co. | 5/17/18 182.00 JDAI State Exec. Mtg.
Municipal Court
Mag. Jerry Packard Independence | 5/11/18 50.00 Judicial College
Public Defender
Stacie Haneline Dayton 6/1-6/18 200.00 National Defender Trng. Project
Treasurer
Dawn Zerrer Columbus | 5/14-16/18 559.00 CTAO Spring Conf.

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted a?d‘joumaliged by said Board on gaid date.

-

L]

v,

Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea




Resolution No. 2018-181

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Squect: Special Event Expense Approval

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

Department Event Date Expenses
Not to Exceed

Job & Family Fraud Awareness Month May 2018 $3,750.00
(Marketing Materials $3,150.00 and Radio Station
Promotion $600.00)

Job & Family Wayne County Fair 9/8-13/18 $2,520.00
(fair booth fee $670.00; fair tickets for booth attendees
$292.00; outreach materials/marketing $1,558.00)

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
|, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted Wﬂed\by said Board on said date.



Resolution No. 2018-182

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Suﬁ_ject: Approval of Plat for Bryor Ridge Subdivision

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the plat for Bryor Ridge
Subdivision located in Franklin Township, NW Qtr. Sec. 35, T-15N; R-13W, Wayne County, Ohio,
owned by Joshua D. Garrison; Bryor Ridge Properties, is hereby approved.

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
I, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Chio, hereby certify that

the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted ancﬂpumaﬁzed\by said?p ’:Zmd date.
!

' ‘Diane-t AustenRferk. |




Resolution No. 2018-183

Board of Wayne County Commissioners
Ann M. Obrecht  Sue A. Smail Ron Amstutz

Adopted: April 18,2018
Subject:  Authorization to Accept Unit Prices for Equipment and Labor Rates

It was moved by Mrs. Obrecht and seconded by Mr. Amstutz that the following resolution be
adopted:

NAME:

Albrecht Trucking Co., Inc. Melway Paving Co., Inc. Treemasters Tree Service, Inc.
6809 Spencer Lake Rd. 7571 State Route 83 6440 Lafayette Rd.

Medina, OH 44256 Holmesville, OH 44633 Medina, OH 44256

Purpose: This award is not for construction, but to accept unit prices bid for Various
Equipment and Possible Labor Rates to be furnished upon order of the Wayne
County Engineer for the 2018 Construction Season

Cost: unit prices (see Exhibit)
Effective Date: 4/18/2018

The vote is as follows: Ann M. Obrecht yea  Sue A. Smailyea Ron Amstutz yea

CERTIFICATE
l, Diane L. Austen, Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Wayne County, Ohio, hereby certify that
the above is a true and correct copy of the resolution adopted and journalized by said Board on said date.




WAYNE COUNTY COMRSSIONERS
423 WEST LIBERTY ST
WOOSTER OH 44591

$ A ! ]
LABOR RATE

Bi05 OPENED: Aprit 6, 2010

ALERECHT TRUCKING COMPANY, INC, WELWAY PAVING CO, INC

|08 SPENCER LAKE FOAD
METTHA, CH €238

1574 STATE ROUTE 83
HCLMESVILLE, OH M311

A 13TLUT
TAX, 3R 1132043

|&. mangarrrctin.ciing com E:

FH 1X-270-0000
FAX. 130-I2%-5002

TACEMASTERS TREE SERVICE iR,
BMDLAFAYTITIE FO
MEDIVA, Ort 4475

P ITIHN
FAZ, Y8614 2T

oOmelwayTIvng e EE treertuston office Gorral.com

Excavator

Excavalor1 . iy g s bt B e A
EXZIVIION 2 © i vommrshbisi it s i s
Extavaior3

Excavaior 4

|Se Shest 1 for bid detalls $o0 Shast 2 for bid catals

See Shest 2 for bid cetails

X o Bid No Bid

MO

No Bid

| Bymp Trughk

Oump Treck ¥ alo s Bl o p
Durp Truck 2 ... i ik
Dump Truck 3

Dump Truck 4

Dump Trues 8

Dump Trucx &

No Bid

] MM

Qfi-Road Dutap Teirck
[ndicate - Horsepower
Dump Teuek 1

Dump Truck 2

No Bid Mo Bid

Ho Bid

Bullkdazer

Buf! Dazer 1

Buli Dozer2 .. ..
Bull Dozerd ... .
Bull Dozer4d .

X No Bid

No Bid

Backhoe

Backhoa 1.

Backhoe 2 . ., 2

Baskhoa 3 . .

X No 8ld

No Bid

Skid Stesr - List attachments agg[lag{g_-gngm Ele,

Skd Sleer 1
Skid Sleer 2
Suid Stear 3

X No Bid

LR

Rotary Broom 1. .
Rodary Broom 2

X No Bid

No Bld

Eaquipmant Teallar
Trailer 1 .

Traler2 F s bk i
Tralera ... .. s i
Teralier 4

No Bld

o

e

MW

Roter {
Roter 2

No Bid

=

No Bid

_Piate Compacior
Compacioe {
Compacior 2

X No Bid

No Bid

= Lliat
Farm Teactor 4
Farm Tracior 2
Fam Tracior J

ach

No Bid

>xox

No Bid

ScraperPan - Pull Type
Scapes 1. LR,

No Bid

x

No Bld

Tractor for Pull Type Scrapert ...
Traztor far Pull Type Scraper 2

No Bid

| .ScracarPan - Sell-Propeiled
Scraper 2

Mo Bid No Bid

No 8ld

bt

’P\e.‘.s. Q“Olg— Ig'i




WAYNE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
428 WEST LIBERTY 5T
WOOSTER OH 44631

& R AND
LABOR RATE g
BIDS OPENED: Apdl 6, 2018

ALBRECHT TRUCIGHG COUPANY, INC.
££29 SPEMCER LAKE 504D
MEDINA, OH 44258

PH 230-722-3478
FAX 130-T22- 2242

Rood Grader i~k
Road Grader 1 ,. : §
Road Grader 2. e T

JE. markGaibrachtirucking. com

Wmm\’ﬂm £O. INC,

1511 STATE ROUTE 1
HOUMESVILLE OH 44813

FAL 330-278-9002
E_estmating medwaypaving. com

LPH: 07T

TREEMASTERS TREE SEFVICEINC,

5440 LAFAYETTE RO
MEDHHA, OH 44258

P 130- 750
FAX: 300-567-4207
E. treamaston. officegmall com

No Bid

No 8id

latin r -lista I
Arfculating Loader 1, . .o i
Artfcutating Loader 2 ; L dpre meeiid

No Bid

No Bid

T
Bucket Truck 1.. P T 0, el ol
BucketTruck 2... .. . ”

Buchet Truch 3

No Bid

No Bld

_Wood Chipper

Wood Chippari.... ...
Wood Chipper2... . .
Wood Chipper 3

No Bid

No Bid

Logying Truck With L gader * =

Log Loader Hauler 1
Log Loader Hauler 2.
Log Leader Hauler 3

No Bid

No Bid

_Chipper Trugk,
Chipper Truck 1. ... =
Chipper Truck 2. .. et srearrasrmrers e
Chipper Truck 3. S——

No Bid

No Bid

Stumg Grinder,
Stump Grinder2... .. .. F
Stump Grinder 3

No Bid

No Bid

I [ Tando
Asphall Truck 1 e s i L A
Asphai Tk 2 o
Asphatt Truck 3 2 b o C T e
Asphalt Truck 4
Asphalt Truek 5
Asphail Truck 6

No 8id

Asphalt Rfmr
Asphah Roiler 1
Asphalt Roller 2
Asphaft Roller 3
Asphalt Roker 4

No Bld

No Bid

No Bid

Mobillza ! ipm F
1 Day Project ... .. e rra s g
2 Days or Longer Project Equipment left on Site,

”nx

Na Bid

Traifi

Traffic Controf Signs

Synchronized Light System (Includes cones)
Typa [ Basricades

No Bid

>

_Labor
(1101
Flagger.. :

HAHMM, XM

No Bid

HH MR

&
g

No Bid

NoB8id

No Bld

No Bid

No Bid




Albrecht Trucking Company, Inz.

SHEET1
[Equipment CostHour Detaits
Altachments
Excavator Manufachsrar Moded - Horsepawer - Welght
Larpe Mend 350.00 Cat 304 CCR - 43 8hhp - 11.044 s 1T, 167, 36"48" Ditchhydraufc thumb & couples
Mid $30.00 Kobeico 135 SR2. 92 8hp - 30424 Ibs 187, 24", 36°, 48/86° Dilch hydrauic quick coupler
Mid S0 00 Joha Ceere 4300 « BOhp - 29,500 lhs 18, 24", 36°, 45°/86° Ditch hydraufic quick coupler
Lage $150.00 Kobelen 220 - 153hp - 54,5000 tbs 54°, 66° Ditch
Dump Truck Manutachaer Model - Payload Capacily - Cost Hr Idie
Siogla axls 330 bp $40.00 Intamational 5100 - 8 lons - $0.0
Tandam 4340 hp $45.00 Kemarorth T800 - 14 tons - S0 0
Tandem 640 hp $45.00 | Pederbit 355 - 15 tons - 500
Tebazke 400 hp $50.00 Jemworth W-800 - 17 tans - $G.0
5 Axle 430 hp $60.00 Kenworth T-800 - 22 tons - $0.
Semi 400-430 bp $60.00 Kenvorth T-800 - 20-27 tons - 040
Bulldozer Manutachirer Modat - Blada Width - Weght
$50.00 Case 850G - 110° - 18,600 s
$130.0¢ {Homalsts D68 - 14'- 46.800 bbs
|
Backhoe Manufachrer Model - Horsepower - Welght
$45.00 Casa 580 Super M - 85 - 18,128 bs 4 in ons bucket, forks, 177, 18°, 247, 36%40" ditching
Skid Steer Manufacturer Model - Bucked Width - Weight
$50.00 Bobeat T-300 - £8* - 9,800 bs ForHE brush mower4 in one bucke/Grapple-oot rake
$65.00 Case STONXT - 84° - 14,500 Ibs Leadet/Landscaper (Skipleader) Bax blads with nppers
Rotary Broom
$45.00 ISweepsier wi tractor - 707 width
Equipment Traller Manufaciurer Modal - Paylnad Capacity - Length
$20.80 Trad King TAG-TK40 - 20 Ion - 24' 207 with 4' beaver tal rampstandem
$20.00 Tral Boss Sen (slep dack) - 35 lon - 4.5 31.5 with § beaver ta3 rempsiandem
$40.00 Fruehad Seml (step deck) - 50 fon - 48° 4B trl-anle de-lach
Sheapsioot Roiler {Manufachurer Model - Weight - Drum Width
$30.00 {LeTmemDoub!ed'—'ll.SOOlhs-B‘ Pull behind
$55.00 Bomag 211 pd 3- 25 000 brs - B4’ Setf-propelled
Flate Compacior $300 Stona 5-28 - 20° widh
Farm Tractor Mamriacturer Model - Horsepower - Weight
$£5.00 Casa 570MXT - 70hp - 14,500 bs LoaderfLandseapsr (Skiploader)
$60.00 Case Intemational 7110 - 200t - 16.000 bs 84" Box blade with rippers
4 Wheel Drive - 21" culipacker/ 15’ eftset disc/20’ batwing
$70.00 Case Inteenational 7120~ Z75hp - 22,500 bbs brush hoo/8.5 vd pull pan/15 yd spreaderipull lype sheepstool
Scrapeiffan - Pull Type Manufaciurer Modsd - Weight - Capacity
$35.00 Sodmover 730 - 10,000 bs st + 7.5 yds
Tracter for Pull Type Scraper |Mamuiachrer Madal - Harsepower - Weight
570.00 Case IH 7120 - 275hp - 18.500 ks 4 Whes! Drive
Road Grader [Manutacturer. Mode! - Horsepower - Walght
$100.00 Galon 160 - §700n - 37,000 bs 14" Moldhcard
Articulating Loader Manufacturer Moda! - Horsepower - Weight
$200.00 |Michigan L190 - 290hp - 53,780 Ibs 5 yard Buckat
$175.00 Trojan 3000 - 240hg « 43,000 Ibs 4 yard Butket
Asghalt Truck |Manufactirer. Moded - Horsepower - Payload Cagacily
| Tandem Axle $55.00 Hemworth T-800 - 430hp - 14 fons
Tri-Asle $55 Kenworth W-900 - 400k - 17 tens




Mobliization of Equipment to & from Job Ske

1Day Project §30080

2 Days o Longer Project -

Equipment lefl on site $300.00

| Fraffic Cantrol

Signg 5500

Synchronized Light System
|nchudes cones 350,00

Type I Banicades $20.00

Labor Non BWR PWR
Operator $4500 $80.00
Truck Deiver $4500 $80:00
Labarer $45.00 $80.00
Flagger $40.00 $7500




Metway Paving Co., Inc.

SHEET 2
Equipment Costhiour Delalis
Asphalt Truck Manufaciurer Model - Harsepower - Paylead Capacity

$85.00 18 Ton

$50.00 20T
Grinders: Self Propelied wi Conveyor and Operator(s)

CestHr i
MinCharge | PWR  [Cosl/Day (Blws) PWR CostiWeek (40 hours PWR
Wirtgen 4' grinding head width (1 $450.00 |53,600.00 $18.000.00
Wirigen 6'-6° grindng head width Bir $650.00 1$5.200.00 $26.00000
Paver { Road Widener: Seil Propelied w] Dperatoris)
{BlawKnex Road Widener 2.8

Screed Width Ghr $17500 (5140000 $7,000.00




Treemasters Tree Service Ing,

SHEET 3
Equipment CastfHour Detalla
Attachments
[ump Truck {Manufzcturer Model - Payload Capacily - CostHr o
Single azle 200 kp 1 Ton $15.00 Ford LCF55 - 16 cuyds - 308
Sinple Axle 300hp 1 Ton $10.00 Ford F350 - i cu yds - $0.0
Shid Steer Manufacturer. Model - Butket Width - Welght
32500 Bobeat 5300¢2 - 80-100° - 8,140 s Forestry Cutter, Trea Sheers
53500 Bobcat 5870 - 60-100° - 13,500 bs Graples, palel forks
$35.00 Bobcat $870- 80-100° - 13.500 ks |Buchets many, snow plows
Equipment Traller |Manutachrer Modal - Pavicad Capacily - Langth
$5.00 |Butler t618-7 ton - 16"
10.00 |Appalachian ct1516- 7 172 bon - 14'
20.00 |Econoine Tandem Dual - 20 {oa - 25°
15.00 |intarstaie Tandem Oual - 12 ton - 25°
[Bucket Truck Manufactirer Model - Boom Heght
§$2500 International 4300 - 65 - V0260
$25.00 International 4300 - 60 - XT55
Wood Chinper Manttacturer Model - Horsepower - Feed Sta
$H500 Woodsriian 20 - 375hp - 24°135°
$35.00 Woodsman 18xx - 275hn - 19236
350 [Terex 770 - 200hp - 19°324°
]
Logging Truek with Loader |Manutaciurer Model - Horsepower - Payioad Cepaclty
$4000 Iwemaﬁmalﬂﬂo_-gﬂlp-fitm
$25 00 Peterbilt 320+ 325hp - 10 lon
Chipper Truck Manufacturer, Mode] - Horsenower - Payload Capacty
51060 Internationat 4700 - 2150 - 28 cu yiis
51500 Staring Actema - 280hp - 31 cuyds
$1000 Ford F559 - 0Chp - 15 o yos
Stump Grindar Manutactuer Model - Horsepaower - Cutting Wheel Dia.
Shamp Grinder 122 53600 |Rayzo RGSE - 80hp - 23°
$4000 Bandit 34007 - 140hp - 34*
Hobittzation of Equipment to & from Job SHe
1 Day Project $200.00
2 Days or Longer Project -
Equipment laA on sita 5200.00
Traffic Contro!
Signs $5.00
Labor NonPWR | PWR
| Operatoc se500 | §1iG00
Truck Driver $65.00 110.00
Laborer $E5.00 11000
Flagger $65.00 110.00
Crane with Dperatoris)
Moblirzton | ' Costr
Fes! Non-PWR/ ; :
MnChaps! PWR  |CostDay (Blws) No PWR/PWR CostWeek {40 hours ) Non PWR / PWR
Pelerbdt 2005 Moded 320 50mt
tapacity _$200/$300 |59 /3175 {5720/ $1400 $3.600/ $7,000




